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Josefina Domínguez-Mujica 

Is Full Professor of Human Geography at the University of Las Palmas de Gran 
Canaria (ULPGC-Spain) and Chairperson of the IGU Commission on 'Global 
Change and Human Mobility'. She has published numerous papers in indexed 
journals in WOS (Web of Science) and SCOPUS, books, and book chapters, 
and participated in congresses worldwide and research projects. She is PI of 
the ULPGC research team of the Horizon Europe funded project ‘Re-Place - 
Reframing Non-Metropolitan Left Behind Places Through Mobility and 
Alternative Development’. Her research has focused on urban geography, 
tourism, and migrations in a broad range of issues. 

Title of presentation: The conceptual nexus among (Im)mobilities, left-behind 
areas, and place identity/attachment. 

Cristóbal Mendoza 

Is Researcher at the University of Las Palmas de Gran Canaria (ULPGC-
Spain). He has worked as Professor at the Autonomous Metropolitan University 
(UAM-Mexico) for more than 15 years. He has published numerous publications 
in indexed geography and demographic journals in Web of Science (WOS) and 
SCOPUS, as well as books and book chapters. He is PI of the ULPGC research 
project “Endogenous Local Development and Mobilities in Rural Areas of 
Spanish and Portuguese Peripherical Regions”. His research has been primarily 
centered on international migration, the geography of migrations, rural 
development, and skilled migration. 

Title of presentation: Mobilities and their impacts on local development in 
remote island contexts: El Hierro (Canary Islands, Spain) 

Barbara Staniscia 

Is Professor of Geography of Tourism and Human Mobility and of Geography of 
Food and Gastronomy at Sapienza University of Rome. She is the Scientific 
Secretary of the International Geographical Union Commission on GLOBILITY - 
Global Change and Human Mobility. She is the PI of the Sapienza research 
team of the Horizon Europe funded project ‘Re-Place - Reframing Non-
Metropolitan Left Behind Places Through Mobility and Alternative Development’. 
Her research has focused on urban dynamics and local development, the 
spatial effects of EU policies, rural development and the geography of taste, 
environmental conflicts, tourism, and migration. 

Title of presentation: (Im)mobility in marginal mountain areas: some examples 
from Italy 



Jennifer McGarrigle 

Is an Assistant Professor of Human Geography at the Institute of Geography 
and Spatial Planning (IGOT), senior researcher and member of the Board of 
Directors of the Centre for Geographical Studies (CEG), Universidade de 
Lisboa. She is PI of the Horizon Europe funded project ‘Re-Place - Reframing 
Non-Metropolitan Left Behind Places Through Mobility and Alternative 
Development’. She has published in many indexed journals and her research 
has focused on international migration, urban segregation and residential 
mobility, privileged mobilities and more recently on local development and 
mobility in peripheral regions. She holds a PhD in Urban Studies from the 
University of Glasgow, UK. 

Amandine Desille 

Is a geographer living in Lisbon. Her research work focuses on international 
migration, local governance, the production of place, and visual methodologies. 
She is a postdoctoral researcher in the Re-Place project funded by the Horizon 
programme of the European Commission and coordinated by the Institute of 
Geography and Spatial Planning, University of Lisbon (Portugal). She is also 
co-director of the INTEGRIM Lab. In 2017, she obtained her PhD from the 
University of Poitiers (France) and Tel Aviv University (Israel). 

Title of presentation: Peripheral mobilities: Towards a relational approach in 
research on left-behind places 

 


